DOST-PCAARRD

Department of Science and Technology

PHILIPPINE COUNCIL FOR AGRICULTURE, AQUATIC AND NATURAL RESOURCES
RESEARCH AND DEVELOPMENT

BAGONG PILIPINAS

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
RESOLUTION NO. G-24-71

BAC Resolution Declaring LCRB and Recommending Approval for 8 items
and Failure for 12 items

WHEREAS, the Philippine Council for Agriculture, Aquatic and Natural Resources Research and
Development (PCAARRD) advertised the Invitation to Bid for the project "Supply and Delivery of Q3
and Q4 CY2024 ICT Equipment, Software, and Peripherals for Various Divisions” with an Approved
Budget for the Contract (ABC) amounting to SIX HUNDRED TWENTY-EIGHT THOUSAND FOUR
HUNDRED SEVENTY-FIVE PESOS (PHP628,475.00) at the PCAARRD Website, Philippine
Government Electronic Procurement System (PhilGEPS) and conspicuous places in the
Municipality of Los Barios from October 23 — November 4, 2024,

WHEREAS, no pre-bid conference was conducted;
WHEREAS, a bid bulletin was issued on October 30, 2024;

WHEREAS, bid proposals from two (2) bidders namely: 1) PC LAB Computer Store, and 2) CLEX
E-Xtronics Trading Inc. were received for the bid opening on November 4, 2024;

WHEREAS, one bidder, CLEX E-Xtronics Trading Inc., was disqualified during the bid opening due
to non-compliance with the bid submission guidelines;

WHEREAS, PC Lab Computer Store was declared eligible with financial proposals as follows:

[tem Description ABC (PhP) Financial Bid (PhP)
PC LAB Computer Store

1 |Laptop 16/1TB 85,000.00 84,995.00

2 |Laptop 16/512/8 85,000.00 84,995.00

3 |Laptop 8/512 49,990.00 49,500.00

4 |Desktop Computer 180,000.00 179,996.00

5 |Based Station for wireless VOIP 14,000.00 No Bid

6 |Webcam 1080P 5,000.00 4,980.00

7 |Wireless Handset VOIP 20,000.00 No Bid

8 |Portable scanner 44,985.00 67,476.00

9 |Portable SSD 1TB A 12,000.00 11,998.00

10 |PowerBank 16,000.00 No Bid

11 |VolIP Phone (wired) 5,600.00 No Bid

12 |Port Replicator (9 in 1) 10,000.00 9,975.00

13 |Office Productivity Software 5,000.00 4,999.00

14 |Proprietary Operating System 10,000.00 9,995.00

15 |Network Attached Storage 30,000.00 29,800.00

- more -
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Item Description ABC (PhP) Financial Bid (PhP)
PC LAB Computer Store
16 |Wi-Fi Dongle 600.00 590.00
17 |Tablet 11 inches 48,000.00 47,999.00
18 |Tablet Case with Keyboard 3,000.00 No Bid
19 |UPS Battery 1,800.00 No Bid
20 |Charger with cable 2,500.00 2,499.00

WHEREAS, upon evaluation of the TWG for ICT, PC Lab Computer Store was found to have
complied with and responsive to all the requirements and conditions in the bidding documents;

WHEREAS, upon post-qualification of the TWG for ICT, PC Lab Computer Store (Items 1, 6, 9, 12,
14, 15, 17, and 20) was found to have the lowest, complying and responsive bids;

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE as it
is hereby RESOLVED to declare and recommend to the Executive Director of PCAARRD a) the
award to PC Lab Computer Store for ltems 1, 6, 9, 12, 14, 15, 17, and 20 in the total amount of
TWO HUNDRED TWO THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED FORTY-ONE PESOS ONLY
(PhP202,241.00), b) failure of bidding for 12 items (2, 3, 4,5, 7, 8, 10, 11, 13, 16, 18, and 19), and
c) the conduct of mandatory review and evaluation of the terms and conditions, specifications of the
said items (Section 35.1 - 35.5 of RA 9184 and its IRR) for re-advertisement and rebidding
purposes.

Bids and Awards Committee:
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Approved:

REYPC::/O V. EBORA

Executive Director
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