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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
RESOLUTION NO. G-19-29

BAC Resolution Declaring LCRB and Recommending Approval

WHEREAS, the Philippine Council for Agriculture, Aguatic and Natural Resources Research
and Development (PCAARRD) advertised the Invitation to Bid of the project “Suppiy and
Delivery of Office Supplies, Furnitu re, and Prepaid Cards” with an Approved Budget for the
Contract (ABC) amounting to ONE MILLION ONE HUNDRED THIRTY SIX THOUSAND FIVE
HUNDRED EIGHTY NINE PESOS ONLY (PhP1 ,136,589.00) at the PCAARRD Website,
Philippine Government Electronic Procurement System (PhilGEPS) and conspicuous places in
the Municipality of Los Bafios from Qctober 18 to November 11, 2019,

WHEREAS, 347 School Office Supplies, Inc. and PRT Technology Solutions, inc. participated in
the pre-bid conference on October 29, 2019;

WHEREAS, bidding proposals from four bidders, namely: PBT Technology Solutions, inc., 347
School Office Supplies, Inc.. SMS Marketing, and Silver Pulp Trading were received for the
opening of bids on November 11, 2019 with financial proposals as follows;

i ~' Financial Bid (PhP)

. PBT | 347 School | SMS | Silver Pulp |

f L ABLHRIF | Technology ; Office ’ Marketing | Trading |
! | Solutions, | Supplies, ;

;_,..._ e e e R AR g b e e R et | o N h"!(,:__, : inc:m.,,,ﬂ,,,,i,_,___.______ __....___.._...:‘.. ot O ——. |

Lot A (Office Supplies; 232,555.00 1 NoBid 226,448 25 | 196,007.25 151.814.75

—~ Common) | 5 L

Lot B (Office Supplies| 719,835.00 610,072.00| No Bid 622,590.00 ‘ 568,518.50

— Consumables) ‘ e

Lot C (Office Supplies 50,619.00 No Bid | 34,110.00 ] 30,520.00 22,177.50 !

— Special) MR o

Lot D (Prepaid Cards) 14.280.00 No Bid No Bid 14,220.00 | 14,197.50 |

Lot E (Fumiture) | 119.300.00 NoBid  117,897.50 | 109,200.00 | No Bid |

Total 1 1,136,589.00 1 610,072.00 [ 378,455.75 | 972,537.25 | 756,708.25 |

WHEREAS, upon post-qualification of the TWG for Supplies and Materials, Siiver Pulp Trading
with the lowest calculated bid for Lots A, B, C, and D and SMS Marketing with the lowest

calculated bid for Lot E were found to have complied with and responsive to all the requirements
and conditions in the bidding documents:
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NOW, THEREFORE, We. the members of the Bids and Awards Committee. hereby RESOLVE
as it is hereby RESOLVED to declare Silver Pulp Trading as the bidder with the lowest
calculated responsive bid for Lots A, B, C, and D in the amount of SEVEN HUNDRED FIFTY
SIX THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED EIGHT PESOS & 25/100 (PhP756,708.25), and SMS
Marketing as the bidder with the lowest calculated responsive bid for Lot E in the amount of
ONE HUNDRED NINE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED PESOS ONLY (PhP109,200.00), and to
recommend to the Executive Director of PCAARRD the award of contract at its respective bid
price.
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Approved:
REYNALDO V. EBORA
Execdtive Director™
Date: __11]21 /12
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