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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
RESOLUTION NO. G-19-23

BAC Resolution Declaring SCRB, Recommending Approval, and
Failure of Bidding for ltem Nos. 1-2 & 5-8

WHEREAS, the Philippine Council for Agriculture, Aquatic and Natural Resources Research
and Development (PCAARRD) advertised the Invitation to Bid of the project “Supply and
Delivery of ICT Equipment and Peripherals” with an Approved Budget for the Contract
(ABC) amounting to SIX HUNDRED FORTY FIVE THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED PESCS
ONLY (PhP645,100.00) at the PCAARRD Website, Philippine Government Electronic
Procurement System (PhilGEPS) and conspicucus places in the Municipality of Los Bafios
from September 24 to October 14, 2019;

WHEREAS, no bidder participated in the pre-bid conference on October 2, 2018;

WHEREAS, only Pinnacle Sphere Enterprises submitted its bid proposals for the opening of
bids on October 14, 2019 with financial proposal as follows:

ITEM ABC (PhP} FINANCIAL BID
(PhP)
1. PoE switch 14,500.00 14,500.00
2. Speaker w/ subwoofer 4,000.00 No Bid
3. Video Conferencing Unit 14,000.00 ~14,000.00
4. Al-in-One printer %0,200.00 10,200.00
5. Al-in-One printer 14,000.00 No Bid
6. All-in-One printer 20,000.00 No Bid |
7. Portable computer 450,000.00 441,000.00
8. Android tablet (Wi-Fi + Cellular) 57,000.00 } No Bid |
9. Multi-function printer ~ 23,400.00 23,400.00
10. Laser printer 6,000.00 6,000.00
11. UPS 24,000.00 24,000.00
12. External Hard drive 8,000.00 8,000.00
TOTAL 645,100.00 541,100.00

WHEREAS, Pinnacle Sphere Enterprises has no bid for item nos. 2, 5, 6, and 8;

WHEREAS, upon post-qualification of the TWG for ICT, Pinnacle Sphere Enterprises was
found to have complied with and responsive to all the requirements and conditions in the
bidding documents except for the specifications on item nos. 1 (PoE switch) and 7 (Portable
computer);

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby
RESOLVE as it is hereby RESOLVED to declare the following: 1) Pinnacle Sphere Enterprises
as the bidder with the single calculated responsive bid for item nos. 3, 4, 8, 10, 11, and 12 in
the amount of EIGHTY FIVE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED PESOS ONLY (PhP85,800.00) and
to recommend to the Executive Director of PCAARRD the award of contract at its respective
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bid price; and, 2) bidding for item nos. 1, 2, 5, 6, 7, and 8 a failure and to recommend the
conduct of mandatory review and evaluation of the terms and conditions, specifications, cost
estimates of the said items (Section 35.1 - 35.5 of RA 9184 and its IRR) for re-advertisement
and rebidding purposes.

Bids and Awards Committee:

RICHARD E. AMANSEC FEZOILAUZ C. DECENA ROMEC PMSANTIAGO

Member ember Member
Losnn
MARI-ANN M. ACEDERA LEILA C. AMERICA MFLVIN B. CARLOS
Member (Provisional) Vice Chairperson Chairperson

Approved: b
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Executive Director "
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